
 

J apanese culture is world-
renowned, making the country 
popular among tourists. Yet, 

due to the popularity of certain 
tourist attractions, over-tourism has 
become an issue. Focusing only on 
famous tourist attractions might 
mean missing out on a deeper, more 
authentic cultural experience. Addi-
tionally, an increased stream of rev-
enue for smaller attractions can go 
further toward uplifting the local 
community. To better understand 
these potential benefits, we spoke 
with two small galleries to hear 
their views on how supporting 
smaller tourist attractions is benefi-
cial. 

 Mr. Masumitsu Hiramatsu is the 
CEO of Oriental Entertainment and 
an alumnus of the Nagoya Universi-
ty of the Arts. He founded Auto Gal-
leria LUCE in 2004 to share his 
passion for automobiles and art. In 
addition to his rotating gallery, he 
hosts several car-related events in 
Nagoya throughout the year. The 
gallery itself has a warm and invit-
ing ambiance that directs attention 
to the exhibits and reflects the di-
rector’s enthusiasm. 

 For Mr. Hiramatsu, the gallery is 
more than a display case. Auto Gal-
leria LUCE is designed to educate 
the public about the automobile’s 
role in Aichi Prefecture’s develop-
ment and in Japanese culture over-
all. Mr. Hiramatsu said, “The back-
bone of Nagoya, Aichi Prefecture is 
cars. Sometimes we do not realize 
that we are being supported by au-
tomobiles and transportation. They 
have become a necessity of life. My 
goal is to share my knowledge and 
passion for cars with everyone.” 

 It is true that Aichi Prefecture 
owes much of its economic success 
to the transportation industry, since 
it is where Toyota is located. Conse-
quently, the prefecture is awash 
with passionate car enthusiasts, 
such as Mr. Hiramatsu. When asked 
about the potential advantages 
smaller galleries have over larger 
ones, he highlighted the intimacy 
between visitors and the exhibits: 
“Users can easily visit and become 
interested in small attractions be-
cause of their casual feeling.” 

 Above all else, the gallery seeks to 
emphasize the automotive indus-
try's significance to Aichi Prefecture 
and its contribution to the local 

community. “I believe that this ex-
hibition is a big step toward change 
in Nagoya City,” said Mr. 
Hiramatsu. “The gallery and car 
exhibition’s purpose is to assist the 
Aichi automobile industry. Nagoya 
City also supports our events.” 

 Fostering a symbiotic relationship 
between communities and their 
tourist attractions reduces the risk 
of losing important cultural touch-
stones. It also allows for new oppor-
tunities for local residents, as we 
found during our visit to the Meito 
Art Museum. 

 One of the first characteristics you 
notice when visiting the Meito Art 
Museum is the soft lighting and the 
quietness, creating a peaceful and 
relaxing environment for visitors. 
The paintings have plenty of room 
between one another, giving their 
elegance ample breathing space.  

 Larger pieces are placed in an area 
with taller roofing, offering im-
proved lighting for an enhanced 
viewing experience. Their presence 
almost fills the whole room, giving 
the space a unique atmosphere. The 
museum is located in Nagakute 
City and exhibits many Japanese 
artworks. 

 We discussed with the curator 
what the benefits are of having an 
art museum in Nagakute City. 
While the number of visitors and 
artworks on display are much 
smaller than those at larger art gal-
leries, the Meito Art Museum lever-
ages this to gain unique benefits. 
The curator went on to say, “It con-
tributes to the local people and visi-
tors. For example, it is easier to give 
an opportunity to local school chil-
dren to learn about and be interest-
ed in art. It also gives an opportuni-
ty to local art university students in 
Nagakute to exhibit their artwork 
in the Meito Art Museum.” 

 Additionally, the size creates a 
comfortable atmosphere for visitors 
to enjoy the exhibits in greater de-
tail. The Meito Art Museum moved 
from Nagoya City to Nagakute City 
hoping that the new location would 
feel more relaxing for patrons who 
can enjoy looking at the exhibits in 
tandem with a Japanese garden. 
The curator said, “The museum dis-
plays a quantity of artworks that is 
neither too much nor too little, so 
visitors won't be tired while they 
are looking at the artworks.”  

 Additionally, the museum hosts 
events where the curator explains 
the exhibits, allowing visitors an 
opportunity to learn in greater de-

tail. From this interview, it can be 
said that having the museum in a 
smaller area helps prevent over-
tourism. The curator thinks that 
this is a big problem in Japan. 
There is an increasing number of 
people coming to smaller art muse-
ums to avoid the drawbacks associ-
ated with over-tourism. 

 Local tourism can be defined as 
activities and experiences that are 
available to tourists in a specific 
geographic location, such as a city 
or prefecture. Local tourism bene-
fits the economy of the region and 
supports the livelihoods of resi-
dents. Locals share their culture 
and heritage which builds pride and 
identity within the community and 
broadens visitors’ understanding of 
a destination through cultural ex-
change. This form of tourism offers 
an authentic, memorable, and im-
mersive travel experience. Specifi-
cally, in Japan tourism is the sec-
ond-largest export industry. Accord-
ing to The Japan News by Yomiuri 
Shimbun, international visitors 
spent approximately 4.8 trillion yen 
in Japan in 2019, which is about 1% 
of the nation’s gross domestic prod-
uct (GDP). 

 Recently, over-tourism has become 
an emerging issue at popular desti-
nations such as Kyoto and Tokyo. 
As a potential solution, in 2020 the 

Japanese government established 
the Cultural Tourism Promotion 
Act, which aims to revitalize un-
derrepresented regions to encourage 
culture-driven regional tourism. 

 Diversifying tourist attractions by 
investing in local attractions pre-
sents important opportunities for 
small business promotion while pre-
serving regional cultural practices. 
Travelers often seek unique special-
ties such as cuisine, crafts, souve-
nirs, and historically significant 
items. Additionally, famous prod-
ucts like Nagasaki castella or Kobe 
beef are synonymous with the cities 
they originate from, revealing the 
strong connection between regional 
identity and local gastronomy. Osa-
ka’s takoyaki and okonomiyaki and 
Nagoya’s miso katsu are also known 
as unique icons of the two cities. 

 By prioritizing these distinct offer-
ings, communities can strengthen 
their economies and offer visitors an 
immersive experience that goes be-
yond mainstream tourist hotspots. 
This holistic approach will help Ja-
pan preserve its distinctive cultural 
heritage, support sustainable tour-
ism methods, enhance economic de-
velopment, mitigate over-tourism, 
and offer genuine, enjoyable travel 
experiences. 
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“J apan is often admired for 
its harmony, but at what 
cost?” For those who stray 

from societal norms, like those in 
punk subcultures, conformity can 
feel stifling and unfair. 

 In an exclusive interview, we spoke 
with Mr. Mune Kato, owner of the 
punk bar ‘Red Dragon’ and the man 
who brought Hells Angels to Japan. 
We discuss his opinions on this mat-
ter and his justifications of why cer-
tain aspects of punk elements need 
to adhere to societal standards, and 
the elements of punk and lifestyle 
that he believes deserve respect. 
This led us to further our investiga-
tion by surveying Japanese students 
to gather their opinions on whether 
Japan’s standards are unfair and 
outdated, or whether these societal 
standards are a necessary function 
to maintain harmony in Japan.  

 Appearance plays a significant role 
in maintaining this sense of harmo-
ny. Modesty and professionalism are 
often seen as non-negotiable, shap-
ing everything from school uniforms 
to corporate dress codes. Straying 
from these norms can lead to social 
repercussions. Societal guidelines 
govern behavior and appearance, 
reinforcing traditional values. 

 Many individuals feel compelled to 
follow conventional routes—
pursuing stable, corporate roles, 
even when these choices conflict 
with their personal ambitions. 
While these norms help maintain a 
sense of social order, they can also 
create tension for those seeking al-
ternative paths. But what happens 
when someone refuses to conform?  

 For members of alternative subcul-
tures, such as punk and rock com-
munities, breaking away from these 
rigid expectations isn’t just a choice; 
it’s a statement. Often misunder-
stood and judged for their appear-
ance, these individuals face unique 
challenges from discrimination in 
public spaces to missed opportuni-
ties in the workplace. Their stories 
offer a powerful lens through which 
to examine the broader question: 
Are Japan’s societal standards too 
strict?  

  In a small punk rock venue nestled 
in Japan’s urban sprawl, Mr. Kato 
has spent over a decade curating a 
haven for alternative music lovers. 
Eleven years of experience running 
the venue Red Dragon, designing a 
clothing brand, and participating in 
the Hells Angels motorcycle group, 
he stands as a symbol of resistance 
to Japan’s strict societal norms.  

When asked about the evolution of 
the punk subculture, Mr. Kato was 
candid: “Most of my regulars are 
older now. I don’t see many younger 
people coming through.” This obser-
vation highlights a potential gener-
ational shift, as societal standards 
continue to prioritize conformity, 
leaving less room for youth to ex-
plore alternative lifestyles. 

 Despite the apparent decline in 
younger patrons, Mr. Kato remains 

steadfast in his belief in preserving 
subcultural boundaries. “Societal 
standards exist for a reason,” he 
said. “They create structure. If eve-
ryone tried to be alternative, it 
wouldn’t be alternative anymore—it 
would lose its authenticity.” For 
him, the integrity of the subculture 
depends on its separation from 
mainstream acceptance. “In a socie-
ty where everything is integrated, 
distinctiveness would disappear. 
Subculture needs to remain sepa-
rate to preserve its strong individu-
ality and pure features.”  

 Mr. Kato also offered advice for 
navigating employment as a mem-
ber of an alternative subculture. “If 
you want to have socially unac-
ceptable styles like ‘weird’ hair-
styles or tattoos, you need to ac-
quire some skills to make a decent 
living with your strong individuali-
ty,” he said. This reflects a practical 
approach to blending personal ex-
pression with societal realities. 
“Life will be hard, but it’s important 
to stay true to who you are.” 

 As a member of the Hells Angels, 

Mr. Kato has been featured in alter-
native and motorcycle magazines, 
cementing his role as a prominent 
figure in the scene. But his experi-
ences go beyond Japan’s borders. 
His travels to European countries 
introduced him to global issues such 
as immigration and discrimination. 
These experiences, coupled with 
friendships in the punk communi-
ty—many of whom grew up in sin-
gle-mother households—deepened 
his awareness of societal struggles. 

 This awareness spurred Mr. Kato 
to action. He began volunteering 
and organizing charitable events, 
such as the Christmas Bash Toy 
Run, which provides gifts to or-
phaned children during the holi-
days. For Mr. Kato, punk is not just 
about rebellion but also about build-
ing a better society.  

 In reflecting on Japanese societal 
expectations, Mr. Kato acknowledg-
es their influence but critiques their 
rigidity. “I think there are still 
many Japanese people who act in 
order to meet social expectations,” 

he explained. “Everyone is not yet 
strong enough to show their individ-
uality. If you are strong, both men-
tally and physically, you make space 
in your mind to be kind to others.” 
Through his work and passion, Mr. 
Kato provides a space for those who 
feel out of place in Japan’s rigid so-
cial structure, highlighting the im-
portance of subcultures like punk in 
offering an alternative path, one 
where individuality can thrive and 
social consciousness can flourish. 

 We also conducted our own survey, 
sending it to Japanese people to 
gather information on how they feel 
about the societal standards they 
face firsthand, as well as their 
views and opinions of punk subcul-
tures and tattoos. Notably, 62.3% of 
respondents chose “Job” in answer 
to the question “Which part of life 
do you think has the most societal 
expectations?” One participant ex-
plained, “I had to dress up really 
formally as a candidate, which I felt 
was a strong societal pressure. I felt 
there was an atmosphere where I 
was not allowed to express my per-
sonality through appearance and 
was forced to be like every other 
candidate.” Referring back to our 
interview, Mr. Kato emphasized 
that if you look aesthetically against 
the societal norm, you should expect 
to be treated differently and must 
be innovative in creating your own 
opportunities to live with this 
“strong individuality.”    

 Another question we asked the sur-
vey participants was their level of 
acceptance toward Japan’s punk 
and alternative culture, with 41.2 % 
indicating a  “middle-of-the-road” 
stance. This neutral outlook sug-
gests that modernism and bolder 
visual expressions are becoming 
increasingly accepted. Furthermore, 
89.5% of respondents were between 
ages 18 and 24, implying that the 
youthful attitude of Japanese stu-
dents may be softening  traditional 
societal standards. Although Mr. 
Kato stated that he observes fewer 
younger patrons engaging with the 
subculture, our findings reveal a 
quiet shift in perspectives, with 
younger individuals showing great-
er openness to alternative lifestyles 
than appearances might suggest.  

 While the ambiguity of opinions 
and the ever-evolving social land-
scape make a definitive answer elu-
sive, our interviews and survey 
have shed meaningful light on the 
issues of Japan’s social standards. 
Younger generations, as evidenced 
in our results, increasingly embrace 
neutrality toward alternative life-
styles. Yet, the weight of societal 
expectations continues to pose chal-
lenges, particularly in professional 
settings and public perception.  

 The punk community, represented 
by Mr. Kato, offers a powerful ex-
ample of individuality flourishing 
under rigid norms, reminding us 
that self-expression is possible even 
in a society where strict expecta-
tions prevail—and that those who 
stray from the norm can still be val-
ued members of society. As Japan 
evolves, there is growing hope for 
more versatile and inclusive societal 
standards. 

  Society  

Are Japanese Societal 
Standards too Strict? 

Pඎඇ඄ Cඎඅඍඎඋൾ ๟ Vංൾඐ 

By Sadie BRUCE, Husnain S. A. 
MOHAMMED, Beau S. P. MOR-
GAN, and Ikumi NAKAGAWA 

Interview with Mr. Kato
(at the back), the owner 
of the punk bar ‘Red 
dragon’, Nagoya City, 
Aichi Pref. 
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Q: Which part of life do 
you think has the most 
societal expectaƟons? 

(pick as many as you want)  

Q: What do you think 
about Japan's punk and 

alternaƟve subcultures?   
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A ccording to the Global Gen-
der Gap Index, in 2024 Ja-
pan is ranked 118th out of 

146 countries. In a country where 
one might expect progress and mod-
ernization, gender equality still 
does not seem to be improving sig-
nificantly. 

 How do these inequalities impact 
the workplace in Japan? For women 
like Ms. Hanako (pseudonym), a 
board director at an educational 
institute, navigating Japan’s male-
dominated workplaces means con-
fronting issues ranging from sys-
temic discrimination to everyday 
harassment. However, it also high-
lights women’s resilience and deter-
mination to overcome these barri-
ers.  

 Ms. Hanako’s early work experienc-
es were marked by harassment. As 
a university student working part-
time at a movie theater, she en-
countered persistent, inappropriate 
advances from a customer. “A yaku-
za-like thug kept coming to the the-
ater and asking me to marry him 
every time I had a shift. I was so 
disgusted by this that I quit the 
part time job dishonestly,” she re-
called. This incident would not be 
the first, nor the last, in her career. 
Later, she would experience sexual 
harassment from men in the busi-
ness world, in places where alcohol 
was involved, including one man 
who stroked her thigh. “I took these 
incidents as lessons to keep my 
guard up at all times.” 

 She also notes the gender differ-
ences in how she was treated in the 
workplace. As a saleswoman, some 
men would attempt to extort her: “If 
you stay with me for two nights, I 
will place a large order.” These were 
the types of remarks they would 
make. She said that her manager 
took control of these situations and 
blocked those customers. The sup-
port and attention of a manager are 
crucial in such circumstances, and 
Ms. Hanako expressed appreciation 
for her manager’s response. 

 According to the graph             , 
39.5% of 7,780 companies had con-
sultations regarding sexual harass-
ment reports. To add to this, accord-
ing to nippon.com—using data from 
Shikigaku of 2,204 respondents— 
only 36% of the respondents who 
had experienced harassment in the 
workplace had reported it to their 
company. For this reason, you could 
argue that the statistics in the 
graph only represent a fraction of 
the amount of harassment in Japa-
nese companies. The reasons for not 
reporting harassment can vary, but 
59.4% of the respondents who didn’t 
report it felt that doing so would 
achieve nothing. These fears are 
justified: among those who did re-

port harassment, 47.2% said that 
the company took no action in re-
sponse. This work culture forces 
victims of harassment to become 
self resilient rather than rely on 
others to deal with their harassers. 

 Sexual and physical harassment 
are not the only consequences of 
gender inequality in the workplace. 
Ms. Hanako also points out that 
remnants of male-dominated think-
ing from the Shōwa era reveal areas 
that require further effort. For ex-
ample, male supervisors in her com-
pany say things like “our girls” 
when referring to the women in 
their department. There is  an at-
tempt to escape an outdated mind-
set, yet they still cannot fully shed 
the Shōwa mindset. Older male ex-
ecutives from the Shōwa generation 
often perpetuate a male-dominated 
workplace culture, preventing wom-
en from being heard. 

 That is why Ms. Hanako believes 
“if there is a mood in the company 
that gender is not a concern, women 
will feel comfortable taking the first 
step forward.” She also mentioned, 
“male bosses tend to be too preoccu-
pied with harassment issues, which 
makes it difficult for them to effec-
tively manage female subordinates.” 
In such situations, Ms. Hanako 
steps in to mediate. Having both 
men and women as bosses helps to 
diversify the mindsets that bosses 
have and leads to a more inclusive 
and egalitarian company culture. 
McKinsey’s “Women in the Work-
place” report emphasizes how wom-
en in leadership roles can influence 
the overall gender climate in an or-
ganization, particularly when top 
management prioritizes diversity. 

 Ms. Hanako acknowledges the 
challenges of sexism in the work-
place but also points out how, as a 
woman, she has found some ad-
vantages. During her time as a 
salesperson, she did not view being 
a woman as a disadvantage. In fact, 
she mentions that some customers 
became so supportive of her that 
they bought products they didn’t 
need just to help her. She reflects, 
“There is a saying in Japan that 
‘women are charming,’ and there 
are still some advantages to being 
tolerated because you are a wom-
an.” She also explains her approach 
to handling difficult situations: “I 
was lucky to have realized that 
‘winning by losing’ (respecting the 
other person with humility) is not a 
win-win situation, even if you settle 
with words like ‘women are charm-
ing.’” This shows that while women 
may face discrimination, they can 
also turn these challenges into op-
portunities. 

 During Ms. Hanako’s lifetime, Ja-
pan has made significant progress 

in the workplace, particularly in 
supporting women’s career advance-
ment. Maternity leave was institu-
tionalised in Japan in 1947; howev-
er, it only mandated 14 weeks of 
leave. In 1992, a childcare leave law 
was mandated, stating that employ-
ers should aim to provide up to a 
year of leave to either the mother or 
father at 40% of their pay or more, 
in addition to maternity leave. In 
2022, a paternity leave law was 
mandated, which allows men to 
take up to four weeks off within an 
eight week period after the birth of 
the child. This enables both men 
and women to take paternity and 
maternity leave, promoting shared 
childcare responsibilities instead of 
placing the entire burden on women. 

 Ms. Hanako’s experience mirrors 
this shift: “Returning to work, with 
shorter working hours at the re-
quest of employees, and returning 
to the department where they 
worked before taking leave, have 
now become the norm.” Men are 
also starting to take paternity 
leave, and she believes this shift 
will expand over time. The govern-
ment is running initiatives to sup-
port employees taking care leave, 
including subsidies for small and 
medium enterprises if they pay as-
sistance benefits to colleagues who 
cover the workload of workers on 
childcare leave or reduced hours.  

 Ms. Hanako remains hopeful for 
the future, especially as organiza-

tions adapt to societal changes. She 
recalled a TV show in which two 
women shared management posi-
tions on a rotating basis. While 
such an arrangement may present 
challenges, she sees potential in 
experimenting with innovative solu-
tions. 

 Ms. Hanako’s experience highlights 
the still unequal position of women 
in  Japan’s workforce, yet it also 
demonstrates her resilience in over-
coming barriers and building a suc-
cessful career. Her story proves that 
despite persistent inequality, wom-
en can thrive professionally. 

 According to the Global Gender 
Gap, “the share of women in legisla-
tive, senior official, and managerial 
roles [has] increased by +1.7% from 
2023 and +4.6 % since 2006,” re-
flecting the growth of women with 
successful careers in Japan over the 
past 20 years. The government sup-
ports this progress through various 
initiatives in the Basic Policy on 
Gender Equality and Empowerment 
of Women 2024 report, such as 
“developing female human re-
sources who will participate in poli-
cy making and planning processes 
in every sphere.” 
 Ultimately, although there is much 
work to be done, recent improve-
ments and policies indicate that 
Japan is making steady progress 
towards a more inclusive and sup-
portive workplace for women and 
others. 

Gender

By Sylvie L. CHAPPELL, Fei-Yang ZHENG, and Ella S. LEPORINI 

Steady Progress, Yet 
Much to be Done 
Wඈආൺඇ ൺඍ Wඈඋ඄ ංඇ Jൺඉൺඇ  
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Source: Report on the Survey on Harassment in the Workplace 2023 
(Ministry of Health, Labour and Welfare) 



 4                                                                     Nagoya University of Foreign Studies                                               December, 2024 

 

F ashion shows are a vital part 
of the learning process for 
students aspiring to enter the 

fashion industry. From concept de-
velopment to execution, these 
events serve as a platform where 
students can explore their creative 
limits while gaining essential skills 
needed in the professional world. 
We heard from three third-year stu-
dents and one teacher from the De-
partment of Fashion Design who 
participated in a fashion show at 
Nagoya University of Arts and Sci-
ences (NUAS) on October 26, 2024. 
Their responses reveal how fashion 
events contribute to further career 
development, creativity, and a deep-
er understanding of the industry’s 
demands.  

 One of the core themes emerging 
from students’ responses is the sig-
nificant impact that participation in 
a fashion show has on their career 
aspirations and professional 
growth. We asked the students via 
a survey: “Do you want to pursue a 
career in fashion after graduating 
from university?” Out of 15 answers, 
ten students affirm they do and 
hope they can pursue a career in 
this field, while the remaining five 
students are still considering it. The 
fashion world is notoriously compet-
itive; it’s either you make it or you 
don’t, and this uncertainty is a 
shared concern among our respond-
ents. 

 The planning and execution of a 
fashion show, from initial concept to 
final presentation, mirror real-
world challenges in the fashion in-
dustry. Students learn how to 
translate abstract ideas into tangi-
ble designs and see them come to 
life under strict deadlines. As one 
student noted, the ability to manage 
both the creative and logistical as-
pects of a fashion show—whether 
it’s costume design, production, or 
event staging—prepares them for 
the multifaceted nature of working 
in fashion. This experience of creat-
ing something from scratch under 
pressure builds confidence, enhanc-
es problem-solving skills, and 
strengthens students’ communica-
tion abilities in collaborating with 
individuals from different back-
grounds. Event production, team 
collaboration, and time manage-
ment stand out as crucial skills de-
veloped during the process. 

 The challenges students face dur-
ing production extend beyond the 
creative process. For example, the 
struggle of balancing high-quality 
design with budget limitations is an 
inherent part of the experience. De-
spite these struggles, students ex-
pressed how working within con-
straints to achieve a professional 
result taught them resourcefulness. 
One student mentioned that a par-
ticularly strict deadline forced her 
to be both efficient and quick. 

 Students also emphasized the im-
portance of teamwork in organizing 
a fashion show. According to Profes-
sor Kazukuni Uchida from NUAS, 

“By creating a fashion show from 
scratch, students can gain exposure 
to a variety of jobs and subjects, 
broadening their horizons for the 
future.” He implyed that organizing 
such an event as a team would be 
beneficial for the students—even for 
those who ultimately choose not to 
work in the fashion industry. 

 Organising a fashion show requires 
collaboration across various depart-
ments, from design and lighting to 
sound engineering, as well as coop-
eration with models, production 
teams, and photographers. Working 
as part of a team mirrors the indus-
try’s need for designers, stylists, 
and other professionals to work to-
gether to bring a collection to life, 
offering students valuable insights 
into their potential future roles in 
fashion production. 

Bridging the Gap Between Class-
room and Industry 
 While knowledge gained in the 
classroom forms the foundation of a 
student’s education, the live fashion 
show experience offers valuable les-
sons that can’t be learned from text-
books alone. According to the Pro-
fessors of NUAS, the transition 
from concept development to a fin-
ished runway piece is a learning 
curve that sharpens students’ un-
derstanding of real-world fashion 
production. They must deal with 
the unpredictability of live events 
and respond to last-minute chal-
lenges.  

 Participating in a live fashion show 
also allows students to experience 
the pressure of presenting their 
work to an audience. The emotional 
and technical preparations—such as 
rehearsing model movements and 
selecting music—teach students the 
importance of precision and profes-
sionalism. 

Thinking Beyond Conventional 
Boundaries 
 When asked about sources of inspi-
ration, both students and teachers 
emphasized thinking beyond con-
ventional boundaries. One teacher 
encouraged students to explore op-
posing ideas—examining things 
people typically avoid or overlook—
and find beauty in them. This ap-
proach fosters an experimental 
mindset that motivates students to 
create pieces challenging current 
trends. 

 The six concepts featured in NUAS’ 
2024 fashion show—ranging from 
sustainability and human/animal 
experimentation to natural phe-
nomena like diamonds and snow—
demonstrate how fashion shows can 
become platforms for innovative 
storytelling. 

Diversity and Inclusivity 
 A significant theme in modern 
fashion is inclusivity, and universi-
ties are gradually weaving this sub-
ject into their curricula. The Uni-
versal Fashion Association, founded 
by Professor Uchida, has played a 
pioneering role in reaching individ-

uals of all abilities, illustrating the 
program’s commitment to breaking 
barriers and making fashion acces-
sible to everyone. 

By encouraging students to consider 
size diversity, adaptive clothing, 
and universal design, the program 
challenges narrow definitions of 
beauty and fashion. The importance 
of creating clothing that fits all bod-
ies and abilities is a key component 
of the program’s philosophy. 
 
Preparing Students for the Industry 
 As the fashion industry evolves, so 
too does the curriculum of fashion 
programs. The shift towards sus-
tainability, ethical production, and 
diversity is reflected in the collec-
tions students create. They are en-
couraged to use innovative materi-
als, explore sustainable production 
methods, and question traditional 
approaches. Teachers also strongly 
guide them in launching their own 
fashion brands, emphasizing crea-
tivity, business management, and 
resilience against industry challeng-
es. 

 Building a brand requires more 
than just designing clothes—it ne-
cessitates an understanding of the 
market and connecting with audi-
ences. Planning and executing a live 
fashion show offers students a prac-
tical opportunity to gain experience 
they can leverage when launching 
their own labels in the future. In 
university settings, fashion shows 
merge creativity with technical 
skills and real-world business expe-
rience, introducing students to con-
cepts like inclusive design, sustain-
ability, and critical thinking. 

 In the words of one teacher, “If you 
think of something that no one has 
thought of before, you will come up 
with something new.” 

  Fashion 

Fashion Show Shapes  
Future Designers 

Fඈඅඅඈඐංඇ඀ ඍඁൾ Dൺඒඌ ඈൿ NUAS Sඍඎൽൾඇඍඌ 

By Mohamed H. QUZAH, Krista 
C. VAN BAAL, Ada S. ÜNLÜ, 

and Aoi SAKAEDA 

Above: Interview with 
NUAS students, Ms. Maho 
Miyagawa, Ms. Yume Taka-
yama, Sana Matsuda by 
Ada, Mohamed and Krista
(in order leŌ to right) 
LeŌ: PresentaƟon of the 
group with the concept 
Ɵtled “FloƩants chouchou” 

Right: The 
leaflet of 
NUAS Col-
lecƟon 2024 
Below: 
Presenta-
Ɵon of the 
group with 
the concept 
Ɵtled 
“Diamond 
Dust” 
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W hat makes art? What in-
spires creativity? What 
motivates those crea-

tions? Especially in Japan, students 
studying visual arts or participating 
in performance clubs like dance and 
music often pose these questions 
out of curiosity. Yet it seems that 
traditional influence is a major fac-
tor for most young artists in Japan. 
How does traditional influence play 
such an important role in motivat-
ing these students?  

 Many people argue that contempo-
rary art in Japan is grounded in 
older, more traditional forms as a 
source of inspiration for young Jap-
anese art students  pursuing ca-
reers in art. Techniques from an-
cient Japanese art—such as paint-
ing, calligraphy, and certain meth-
ods of sketching—continue to find 
their way into modern works. For 
instance, older sketches and draw-
ings used charcoal on paper scrolls, 
often featuring figures occupying 
most of the scroll with heavy, dark 
outlines. Traditional Japanese art 
was once defined by Britannica as 
an “exquisiteness of form, together 
with simplicity.” The subject matter 
frequently included nature and har-
mony, drawing on “the use of na-
ture, religion, and East Asian phi-
losophies.” Waves, mountains, 
plants, and flowers appeared promi-
nently in these traditional media. 

 Ms. Akiho Kokaji, Japanese stu-
dent at Nagoya University of Arts 
and Sciences (NUAS), seems strong-
ly influenced by traditional Japa-
nese aesthetics, especially the 
works of Japanese artist Kaii Hi-
gashiyama, drawing inspiration 
from nature and their own personal 
emotions. Many traditional Japa-
nese works feature scenes of nature, 
and Ms. Kokaji’s own focus on natu-
ral elements clearly reflects 
this. She states, “I am satisfied with 
my work (Afterwards, I hope some-
one else will be moved by my 
work…),” revealing what some 
might call  an “old soul” approach. 
This outlook on creativity under-
scores her belief on the emotional 
impact of art. 

 Another Japanese student at 
NUAS, Ms. Yuna Tomori, finds sig-
nificant inspiration  in works from 
China—a source that also influ-
enced certain traditional Japanese 
art forms. She admires “fine, deli-
cate lines and realistic expres-
sions” and believes art is “a visuali-
zation of the momentary energy of 
the people living in that period.” In 
her view art becomes a time cap-
sule, capturing the essence of the 
artist’s era and preserving it for 
future audiences. 

 Ms. Tomori also contends that art 
has the power to “move people, to 
inspire them, and to influence some-
one or even some non-human crea-
ture,” suggesting a possible Shinto-
inspired perspective, wherein even 
nature or animals can be affected by 
art. Citing artists like Akira Uno, 
Takato Yamamoto, and Miwa Kon-
do, she points to dark, fine lines in 
their works as having traditional 
influence. 

 Ms. Miku Matsuoka, another young 
Japanese artist at NUAS, holds dif-
fering opinions about what art rep-
resents. She believes that art “gives 
form to one’s arguments, desires, 
and worldview,” emphasizing how 
emotions can drive artistic produc-
tion. “Art brings excitement to life, 
and that excitement ripples out into 
new excitement,” she explains. “A 
world without art would be an un-
stimulating and very boring world.” 
Ms. Matsuoka’s approach indicates 
that excitement is a key motivation 
for creating art, and her bold con-
tour lines and vibrant color choices 
demonstrate the emotional energy 
she invests in her pieces. 

 Performing arts, such as dance and 
music, also played significant roles 
in ancient Japanese culture. Many 
modern Japanese musicians still 
integrate traditional instruments 
and rhymes into their songs and 
performances. Popular artists like 
Kenshi Yonezu and Sakanakushon 
are known for fusing these tradition-
al elements with contemporary mu-
sic. 

 Students participating in perform-
ing art clubs at NUFS and NUAS 
offer diverse perspectives on what 
art means to them. For example, 
Mr. Ryutaro Hijikata, who has been 
playing in a wind orchestra for sev-
en years, was initially inspired by 
watching a marching band. He 
states, “Everyone has to work to-
gether to produce music, even with 
people you do not get along person-
ally. However, we need to tune in 
and match our sounds. I hope we 
can produce more music in which 
we can convey our hearts and souls 
to the audience.” This mindset aligns 

closely with traditional Japanese 
performance arts, like Noh or Raku-
go theater, which also emphasize 
collective harmony and emotional 
expression.   

 Mr. Hijikata further asserts music 
has the power to “bring equality to 
the world,” reflecting his belief that 
music unites people under a shared 
purpose, transcending individual 
differences. 

 A NUFS Japanese student, Ms. 
Tsumiki Katsuragawa, has partici-
pated in an acappella circle since 
her second year of university. She 
credits her interest in acappella to 
the American movie, Pitch Perfect. 
This parallels older historical ex-
changes between Japan and West-
ern countries, where external cul-
tural elements influenced Japanese 
art. Ms. Katsuragawa believes that 
music “enriches our relationships 
and gives us a lot to think about.” 
She also thinks that music “creates 
connections between people.” Her 
statements reaffirm the unifying 
power of music and suggest that 
cross-cultural inspiration can en-
hance and redefine traditional art 
forms in Japan.  

  Ultimately, traditional art remains 
a major motivation for many young 
Japanese artists, but each individu-
al’s interpretation of art shapes how 
it appears in their work. Ms. Tomori 
and Ms. Kokaji both emphasize na-
ture and humanity’s emotional core, 
while Ms. Matsuoka focuses on 
strong human emotions. In the 
realm of music, Mr. Hijikata centers 
on shared emotional expression—
akin to traditional arts—while Ms. 
Katsuragawa integrates western 
music elements, much as some tra-
ditional Japanese artworks once 
absorbed Western influences. 

Entertainment  

By Seoyoung OH, Zania M. 
PELZER, and Rike SONNTAG What Inspires their 

 ArƟsƟc CreaƟvity? 
Sൾർඋൾඍ ඈൿ NUFS ๟ NUAS Sඍඎൽൾඇඍඌ 

<Works and Creators> 
Above: Flower arrangement,  
                                              Akiho Kokaji 
Middle: Love and jealousy to fill up,           
                                              Yuna Tomori 
LeŌ: Flyer for Jigoku fesƟval in 
Noboribetu, Hokkaido,  
                                        Miku Matsuoka 

Interview with Ms. Katsuragawa
(right), singer in a cappella circle of 
NUFS, Nisshin City, Aichi Pref. 

 
 
 

International Students 
+ 

Domestic Students 
 This English-language newspaper, NUFS 
Times, is produced with collaborative team-
work of international students and domestic 
students. All students take the class Global 

Japan Studies Course (GJSC) offered by the 
Nagoya University of Foreign Studies’ Interna-
tional Institute for Japanese Language Educa-
tion(IJLE). 
 All themes are decided by team discussion and 
should cover Japanese society, economy, cul-
ture, education, etc. The students interviewed 
to collect real voices in the field to understand 
realtime Japan. It is full of exciting work! 

Please check our back issues! 
<12th Edition> 
▪ Japanese Advertisement—Its Techniques 
▪ Startup Spirit and Corporate Culture 
▪ The Fukushima Water Release 
<11th Edition> 
▪ The Debate in Japan on Custody 
▪ The Life of Idol “Wotas” 
▪ “Hikikomori” in Japan 

The NUFS Times 
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A cross the world, schools use 
grades to communicate to 
students how well they are 

doing in the classroom. These grades 
can impact how students perceive 
themselves due to the many factors 
involved, such as university options, 
future job opportunities, and schol-
arships. A student’s own mental 
health also seems to be linked to the 
kind of grades they receive, suggest-
ing it may be time to ask: Why are 
grades so important to a student’s 
life in shaping their long-term suc-
cess and well-being?  

 Imagine being back in high school: 
university is around the corner, and 
all that matters is getting a high 
enough grade on your math test to 
be accepted into the school of your 
dreams. You study for weeks and 
invest hundreds of hours, making 
the test all you can think about. 
This anxiety and stress, driven by 
the fear of grades, may have been 
controlling you for some time. The 
question is: Why do grades have 
such a massive grip on students’ 
lives?   

   In order to better understand the 
situations, we interviewed a teacher 
from each country to learn how 
their grading methods work and 
why they are used from the perspec-
tive of someone currently in the 
field. Each teacher was asked the 
same set of questions for compara-
bility.  

 All interviewees have taught or 
currently teach high school students 
in their respective countries. Ms. 
Brittany Foster from the US teach-
es grade 11-12 English, Ms. Jen-
nifer Gakis from Canada formerly 
taught general high school courses 
and now supervises her district, and 
Ms. Naoko Yogo from Japan teaches 
English to Grades 1-3 in high school. 

 Both Western teachers give stu-
dents a quiz once a week or so. In 
the US, grades are determined by 
mastery of the given topic, whereas 
in Canada both mastery and appli-
cation of knowledge are considered. 
The grades students receive deter-
mine whether they can progress to 
the next course and also influence 

which degrees or programs they can 
apply for in university. In the US, 
teachers aim to align grades with 
students’ performance and provide 
encouragement. In Canada, empha-
sis is placed on how well the class 
understands each topic: do they 
need a review or can they speed up?  

 In Japan, tests are given out based 
on the level of difficulty. Grade 1 
classes receive no tests, while Grade 
3 classes have tests every session to 
show mastery of more advanced 
material. These assessments gauge 
how students are able to “think, 
judge, and express themselves.” 
Each aspect is assessed differently: 
thinking through performance and 
debate, judging through discussion, 
and expression through attitude 
and homework.  

 Although teachers guide how their 
class learns and is tested, the stu-
dents themselves must do the work. 
Most students intend to attend uni-
versity: in the US, about 70% plan 
on doing so, while Ms. Yogo notes 
that in Japan, almost all students 

consider university but not neces-
sarily a specific career path. In Can-
ada, with more trade programs 
available, the percentage is slightly 
lower. 

 Of the five US students interviewed 
(all in Ms. Foster’s Grade 11-12 
English classes), three see them-
selves in college or finishing a de-
gree within five years, which re-
quires them to score higher grades. 
On the other hand, two state that 
they do not need degrees for their 
professions.  

 Although students receive many 
grades, this may affect their percep-
tion of school. In the US, Ms. Foster 
states that “some students have 
become dependent on the grade ra-
ther than what the grades actually 
mean.” In Japan, Ms. Yogo hopes 
her grading encourages students to 
“love English, study by themselves, 
and know how to use the dictionary, 
because it is useful for students in 
the future.” 

 Canadian students are seeing in-
creasing test anxiety over the years. 

High-stakes exams like final exams 
for diplomas  especially affect their 
mental health, leading to re-
assessment policies and accommo-
dations nationwide. Ms. Foster 
agrees that “testing is exhausting 
—mentally and physically,” even 
adding that some tests do not re-
flect future careers or social rela-
tions. Students in the US react sim-
ilarly to bad grades. In the West, 
students’ grades are never posted 
publicly; Ms. Gakis states, “They 
should never be made public; as in 
my opinion it would just increase 
anxiety.” While most Japanese 
schools used to display grades, 
Ms.Yogo says that Grade 1 students 
often cry when faced with tests that 

are harder than their junior high 
exams.  Increasingly, students skip 
school out of depression or fear of 
low grades. She also notes, “grades 
have privacy problems, so in this 
school it is never posted.” 

 Parents and their expectations fur-
ther influence students’ stress 
around tests and grades. In the 
West, parents play a major role in 
determining educational and career 
paths. Ms. Foster sees students fol-
low in their parents’ footsteps, while 
Ms. Gakis in Canada sees that “some 
students want to please their par-
ents and in some cases don’t know 
what they want, so they will choose 
the path their parents have set out 
for them.” Japanese parents are 
likewise integral to students’ choic-
es, as students often have limited 
knowledge about jobs and universi-
ties, making parental guidance cru-
cial.   

  Given all this information, what 
adjustments should be made to the 
grading system as a whole? A reas-
sessment policy could reduce stu-
dent stress, allowing them to retake 
tests and thus easing the burden of 
having to ace them on the first try. 
However, there is a risk that some 
students may not put in maximum 
effort if they know a second chance 
is available. Moving toward more 
portfolio-based and assignment-
focused learning may be the way 
forward, allowing students to 
demonstrate knowledge application 
without the constraints of time-
limited exams—a model that aligns 
better with Japan’s emphasis on 
thinking, judging, and expressing. 
As with any new system, further 
experimentation must be done to 
ensure that changes function as in-
tended. 

 Students’ time in school can be 
filled with happy memories and un-
forgettable friends, but the demands 
of academic life weigh heavily. One 
way or another, grades significantly 
impact the classroom experience. 
The question remains: Should 
schools worldwide adopt a Western 
or an Eastern approach to grading, 
or does the grading system need a 
complete overhaul? 

  Education  

EducaƟon System to Adapt: 
 Western or Eastern? 
Cඈආඉൺඋංඇ඀ Gඅඈൻൺඅ Gඋൺൽංඇ඀ Mൾඍඁඈൽඌ  

By Alyssa M. FOULKROD, 
Sayaka HAYASHI, and Kyle W. 

SELESHANKO 

Methods differ 

                      between countries 
 Countries like Japan, the USA, 
and Canada each have different 
grading systems, with pros and 
cons that affect their students 
in different ways. Comparing 
how these countries handle 
grading can give us a better 
understanding of its impact on 
students.  

 Canada uses the A F grading scale, assigned 
through projects, assignments and tests throughout 
the school year. On average, universities require a 
B for acceptance into their programs, meaning that 
anything lower can create stress for students whose 
desired careers require a university degree. 

 The USA shares a similar system to Canada but 

with a higher threshold for each letter grade, mak-
ing it slightly harder for students to earn top 
marks. 

Japan has three level based on achievement 

 Lastly, Japan’s grading system uses letters A-C. 
Instead of showing degrees of success, an A is con-
sidered successful, a B is considered satisfactory, 
and a C is equivalent to a fail.  

Editor in Chief : Masahito YUGE,  Adviser : Shogo SAKURAI,  Adviser & Proofreader : Jacob TEICHRIB 

Through interviews with teachers in 
three countries, the characteristics of 
each educational system were high-
lighted. Left: A high school in Canada 
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W hat do you imagine when 
asked “What is the most 
beautiful food in Japan?” 

It could be sushi, tempura, or suki-
yaki. Wagashi is one of the most 
iconic examples of beautiful food in 
Japan. People are captivated by its 
sophisticated sweetness, smooth 
texture, and unique appearance. In 
particular, the attractive appear-
ance of wagashi has become famous 
worldwide via the internet, and 
both Japanese and foreign audienc-
es enjoy it. Recently, wagashi-
making lessons have become popu-
lar among foreigners. Some wagashi 
shops even offer lessons in 
English and Spanish. What is 
it about wagashi that fasci-
nates so many people? Let’s 
explore the world of wagashi 
together!  

 Wagashi, as we know it today, 
differs from its earliest forms 
in ingredients, visuals, tastes, 
and target audience. The first 
appearance of wagashi in Japanese 
history was over 2,300 years ago. 
These early versions were shaped 
like balls or biscuits and made from 
nuts, but they did not taste sweet 
because sugar did not exist yet. 
Over time, Japan had cultural ex-
changes with many countries, espe-
cially China and Portugal, which 
significantly impacted 
wagashi. Chinese sweets 
inspired wagashi’s beauti-
ful appearance, and Por-
tugal introduced Japan to 
western cooking equip-
ment, such as ovens, al-
lowing for greater variety 
in wagashi. This cultural 
amalgamation shaped 
wagashi into the colorful, 
fancy and beautiful forms 
people recognize today. 
Modern Japanese wagashi has 
gained worldwide popularity on the 
internet. Of course, viewers cannot 
taste it online, but the unique, in-
teresting, and exciting appearance 
of wagashi is attracting viewers 
who have never tasted it before. 

 Just as the first wagashi in Japa-
nese history was not sweet, the bean 
paste filling now considered essen-
tial to modern wagashi also was not 
sweet until sugar became available. 
Originally, red beans were saltened 
rather than sweetened. After sugar 
was introduced from China during 
the Muromachi period, the proto-
type of today’s bean paste emerged. 
Many people think that wagashi 
always contains bean paste, but 
that is not always the case. Look at 
the map of Japan above. Some 
wagashi from different regions con-
tain no bean paste at all. You may 
envision wagashi as only sweet 
items, but there are plenty of 
wagashi that make use of local in-
gredients and are eaten as everyday 
snacks—showing that wagashi is 
more diverse than many assume.  

 Just as taste has evolved, so has 
appearance—which we believe is a 
major attraction of wagashi. To find 
out whether visual beauty influ-
ences people’s interest in wagashi, 

we conducted a survey among 
NUFS students. We asked, “What is 
the most important thing for you 
when you buy wagashi?” The re-
sults showed that 41.7% chose 
taste, 33.3% chose appearance, and 
12.5% chose the season or event, 
indicating that appearance is a cru-
cial factor—second only to taste.  

 Our survey confirms our assump-
tion that people prefer diversity in 
the presentation of food. It can be 
boring to eat the same thing every 
day, especially if it looks like a 
dense, unappetizing bean paste. By 
shaping this dough differently and 
regularly changing it with the sea-
sons, appreciating wagashi becomes 
easier. What do you think, dear 
reader? 

  We interviewed Ms. Haru Minazu-
ki, a wagashi researcher, to get her 
expert opinion on wagashi's appear-
ance. According to her, wagashi be-
came so beautiful due to the tea cer-
emony and its growing popularity 
as a gift. With the development of 
the tea ceremony, wagashi served 
as a sweet for tea ceremonies and as 
a way to impress others. Over time, 

it also became a popular gift for cel-
ebrations and souvenirs, leading to 
greater emphasis on visual appeal 
as something to be served to others. 

 Wagashi's beautiful appearance 
reflects its role as a product. To 
boost sales, shops focus on not only 
taste but also visual appeal. In sum-
mer, when hot weather lowers de-
mand, shops create cooling, season-
al designs to entice buyers. For ex-
ample, a wagashi shop in Kyoto 
sells “Hamazuto,” a clam shell filled 
with amber agar and miso-flavored 
amanatto (fermented soy), evoking 
a seaside feel in a landlocked city—
and it keeps for a long time. 

 Wagashi is deeply connected to the 
seasons. Kurikinton, a wagashi 
made from seasonal chestnuts, is 
available only briefly, so many cus-
tomers purchase it annually at that 
time. Limited-time products are 
more effective at boosting custom-
ers’ desire to purchase. Wagashi 
shops often present kurikinton in 
unique ways—shaped like a chest-
nut, roasted to resemble charred 
chestnuts, or mixed with white bean 
paste for a more affordable option—

depending on region and shop tradi-
tion. In addition, since tea ceremony 
implements are chosen based on 
season, wagashi served at tea cere-
monies must also be seasonally ap-
propriate, underscoring the vital 
role of seasonality in wagashi.  

 It can be said that seasonal 
sales are influenced by the cul-
ture of anticipation. In Japan, 

wearing seasonal patterns early—
like autumn maple leaves on a sum-
mer yukata—is acceptable, but us-
ing items past their season is con-

sidered improper. Similarly, 
wagashi shops stop selling sea-
sonal wagashi once their sea-
son ends, encouraging timely 
purchases. This resembles 
fashion brands launching win-

ter wear right after sum-
mer, highlighting how 
seasonality plays a key 
role in sales strategy.  

 And for our last question, we asked 
Ms. Minazuki why wagashi is so 
popular internationally. Although 
there are many reasons, she noted 
that many people are attracted by 

wagashi’s appearance. For 
those who have never tasted 
wagashi, the appearance is 
the most appealing point. In 
particular, nerikiri sweets—
easily shaped to depict 
themes like Halloween and 
Christmas—can be savored 
by appearance alone. 
Wagashi shops’ desire to 

attract attention extends to explor-
ing new forms of visual expression, 
making wagashi appealing to a 
broad audience.  

 One of our members, an interna-
tional student, experienced the deli-
cate process of making wagashi 
firsthand. 

 The student visited Kanazawa in 
Ishikawa Prefecture. The city was 
the cultural center of the Kaga-
Hyakumangoku clan and, along 
with Kyoto and Matsue, is consid-
ered as one of Japan's three major 
wagashi hubs. Kanazawa hosts 
many long-established wagashi 
shops, and the workshop offers a 
rare chance to make handmade 
flower-, chestnut- and maple-
themed wagashi. Shaping the 
dough proved difficult because it 
melts under the warmth of human 
hands, and care was needed to pre-
vent it from cracking as it dried. 
Anyone would realise that creating 
these intricate sweets requires in-
tensive skill and labor. As more peo-
ple discover wagashi through hands
-on experiences, the number of 
those captivated by this aspect of 
Japanese food culture will likely 
increase.  

 Japanese culture has long valued 
seasonal connections in food, cloth-
ing, and housing, and wagashi also 
embodies these influences. Products 
emerge from a cultural mindset 
that prioritizes seasonality. Looking 
ahead, wagashi will likely continue 
to evolve through creativity and 
novel ideas, adding color to our dai-
ly lives. 

THE BEAUTY OF WAGASHI  

Combining Art, TradiƟon, 
Seasonality, and Hospitality 

Food Culture  
By Jean F. R. DES ARCIS, 

Yukihiro SENDA,  
and Monika TAKADA 

Interview with Ms. Haru Mina-
zuki, a wagashi researcher, 

Nagoya City, Aichi Pref. 
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C ute? Fearsome? Mysterious? 
Yōkai are historical creatures 
originally created to explain 

mysterious phenomena—like eerie 
sounds in the night or shadows in 
the woods. Over time, however, the 
perception of these mysterious be-
ings has changed, and they have 
become pop culture icons. The shift 
in how yōkai are perceived may pro-
vide “hints” that reveal how Japa-
nese people and society have lived 
with the supernatural and mysteri-
ous phenomena, even  today. 

 In Japan, yōkai have generally 
been described as having no human 
form and, above all, living separate-
ly from the human world. This no-
tion was also evident in our survey 
amongst Japanese nationals at 
NUFS. When asked about the dif-
ference between ghosts and yōkai, 
the most common response was that 
ghosts are not living creatures but 
rather the spirits of dead people 
who return for revenge. On the oth-
er hand, many respondents said 
that yōkai “take the form of humans, 
animals, or objects.” 

 A yōkai that takes human form is 
Futakuchi Onna (two-mouthed 
woman). She is said to come and eat 
the resources of families—
particularly those who are stingy—
to punish them. A yōkai that takes 
an animalistic form is Kappa, de-
scribed as a green furless creature 
with a plate rimmed by hair atop its 
head, a bird’s beak, and a carapace. 
One of our survey respondents de-
fined it as “a monster that lives in 
the rivers of Japan [...] dragging 
horses and humans into the water 
and sucking their blood.” Physical-
ly, it has evolved considerably since 
the Edo period, and morally it has 
remained frightening. 

 Yet in our  survey, some respond-
ents described yōkai as cute. But 
how could fearsome yōkai like Kap-
pa be considered cute today? 

 In an interview about Kappa, the 
chief curator of the Hyōgo Prefec-
tural Museum of History, Mr. Masa-
nobu Kagawa, explains that the 
Kappa became “cute” around the 
1950s following the publication of 
the manga Kappa Kawatarō. This 
manga portrayed yōkai as endear-
ing, allowing them to shed their 
frightening aura and become a key 
element of Japanese pop culture. 

 The manga and anime Gegege no 
Kitarō by Shigeru Mizuki (1960) 
focuses on the main character Ki-
tarō, the last survivor of the ghost 
tribe, who attempts to unite the 
yōkai world with that of humans. 
Journalist Ms. Miranda Merrington 
explains that today the Japanese 
imagination of yōkai is largely 
shaped by Mizuki’s depictions. Al-
though yōkai are no longer so 
frightening, thanks to science and 
rational explanations, this might 
clarify why most  have become 
“cute” in Japanese pop culture. 

 Despite this, yōkai can still repre-
sent fear. In the article ‘Expert: 
Yōkai ghouls dwell in ChatGPT in 

modern times,’ Mr. Kagawa states 
that artificial intelligences present-
ing themselves as human are a 
modern form of yōkai. What makes 
them frightening is that they are 
indistinguishable from humans 
(Asahi Shimbun, 2023). According 
to him, yōkai no longer have a suit-
able habitat in our world, but they 
can survive thanks to the internet. 

 As seen with the Kappa, over the 
ages yōkai have evolved, and it is 
their partly immaterial forms that 
enable this. Mr. Kagawa explains 
that yōkai were a form of fear trans-
mitted by word of mouth, and in the 
modern world he compares this to 
rumor. The creation of social net-
works have vastly amplified rumor-
spreading, mirroring the yōkai 
realm. He adds that artificial intel-
ligence—machines giving human-
like answers—resembles yōkai, as 
our inability to distinguish them 
from humans creates fear.  

 To better understand the relation-
ship between yōkai and the new 
generation, we interviewed several 
professors from Aichi Gakuin Uni-
versity (AGU): Prof. Naoko Koba-
yashi, Prof. Gregory Rohe, Prof. Ma-
koto Hayashi, and researcher 
Yamato Sugita. They were uncon-
vinced by Mr. Kagawa’s parallel 

between yōkai and digital fear. 

 Prof. Hayashi defines yōkai as fall-
en gods, in line with folklorist Mr. 
Kunio Yanagita, meaning “the sym-
bolism of the relationship between 
human beings and nature in the 
deepest psyche.” Yōkai were there-
fore not solely creatures to be 
feared; they could also be protec-
tors, and the fear they create is just 
one facet. Mr. Sugita adds, “Yōkai 
were created to explain inexplicable 
fears. They were inspired by sym-
bolic objects and animals that exist-
ed in the country.” 

 Prof. Hayashi explains that many 
yōkai stories circulate in school. He 
cited the Kuchisake Onna (slit-
mouthed woman), believed to have 
appeared in Gifu Prefecture in the 
late 1970s. A man reportedly saw a 
woman standing with her mouth 
open as far as her ears. In ‘Japanese 
Urban Legends from the Slit-
Mouthed Woman to Kisaragi Sta-
tion’, Prof. Yoshiyuki Iikura of Ko-
kugakuin University explains that 
the rumor of this yōkai spread very 
quickly due to higher school enroll-
ment at the time, worrying many 
children. Kuchisake Onna suppos-
edly preyed on children who stayed 
out late, asking them if they thought 
she was pretty. Given her beauty, 

the child would inevitably answer 
in the affirmative. She would then 
remove her mask. If the child react-
ed negatively, she would kill them 
with a pair of scissors. Mr. Sugita 
says that parents used her story to 
scare children into coming home 
earlier.  

 However, Prof. Hayashi believes 
that nowadays parents do not nec-
essarily play a big role in yōkai edu-
cation, but our research found that 
68% of 18- to 24-year old respond-
ents said their parents had used 
folktales to educate them as chil-
dren. One person recalled being told 
about Mottainai Obake (Ghost of 
Waste). Although it wasn’t a yōkai 
in the strict sense of the word, par-
ents would use this story to scare 
children into finishing their food, or 
else the ghost would appear and 
scare them. 

 Undoubtedly, in addition to rumor 
and word of mouth, yōkai have de-
veloped greatly through modern 
media such as anime, video games, 
and more. Media exposure has also 
changed how yōkai are viewed, from 
terrifying entities to lovable crea-
tures. Prof. Kobayashi believes that 
yōkai are in a “second evolution,” no 
longer venerated as they were be-
fore the Meiji period, but instead 
treated mostly as entertainment. 
Indeed, as far back as the Edo peri-
od, Mr. Sugita explains that yōkai 
were written and drawn for amuse-
ment. Influenced by Shigeru Mizuki 
and other authors, he believes that 
yōkai have gained even more enter-
tainment value, aided by new tech-
nologies. 

 The “Yōkai Watch” franchise, as 
explained by Prof. Kazuhiko Ko-
matsu (former director of the Inter-
national Research Center for Japa-
nese Studies), launched a renais-
sance of yōkai  in modern Japanese 
entertainment when they were per-
ceived to be out of vogue. Today, 
yōkai appear in many pop culture 
series, such as the manga and 
anime ‘Jujutsu Kaisen’ by Gege 
Akutami. Indeed, the character of 
Sukuna is inspired by the Yōkai 
Ryomen Sukuna, who, according to 
the historical records of ‘Nihon 
Shoki’, destroyed Empress Jingu. 
‘Dandadan’ by Mr. Yukinobu 
Tatsu—another manga and recently 
aired anime—includes the likes of 
yōkai, yurei spirits, and aliens dy-
namically integrated into the same 
story. It includes modern yōkai and 
urban legends like Turbo Bachan 
(Turbo Granny) from Hyogo Prefec-
ture, who would follow your car 
through tunnels while staring at 
you, and Kuchisake Onna, as previ-
ously mentioned. 

 The perception of yōkai has evolved 
overtime, shifting from being wor-
shiped and feared beings to pop cul-
ture icons often seen as cute. Now 
many authors use yōkai to enrich 
their narratives. Because of this 
ongoing creativity, yōkai have en-
dured from ancient times and keep 
evolving with Japanese culture. Ru-
mors spreading in social environ-
ments such as school and parents’ 
stories have also helped keep yōkai 
alive, developing new yōkai that fit 
contemporary society. 
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Above: Ukiyo-e drawing of the YōkaiÊKappaÊ(leŌ). Imagi-
nary scene of a man being surprised by encountering a 
Kappa, ‘Odawara Kappa : 53 StaƟons of the Tokaido’ by 
Utagawa Yoshikazu (CollecƟon of the InternaƟonal Re-
search Center for Japanese Studies) 
Below: Mr. Gregory Rohe (centre), Prof. of AGU explains 
the yōkai exhibiƟon, Nisshin City, Aichi Pref. 
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